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Village of Lemont 
Planning and Zoning Commission 
Regular Meeting of February 5, 2020 

 
A regular meeting of the Planning and Zoning Commission for the Village of Lemont was held 
at 6:30 p.m. on Wednesday, February 5, 2020 in the second floor Board Room of the Village 
Hall, 418 Main Street, Lemont, Illinois. 
 

I.  CALL TO  ORDER 
 
A. Pledge of Allegiance 

Chairman Studebaker called the meeting to order at 6:30 p.m.  He then led the Pledge 
of Allegiance. 

B. Verify Quorum 

Upon roll call the following were: 
Present:  Carmody, Cunningham, McGleam, O’Connor, Pawlak, Zolecki, Studebaker 
Absent:  None 

 
Community Development Manager Mark Herman, Consulting Planner Jamie Tate, 
and Village Trustee Ron Stapleton were also present.       
 
C. Approval of Minutes -  January 8, 2020 Special Called Meeting 
 
Commissioner Pawlak made a motion, seconded by Commissioner Zolecki to 
approve the minutes from the January 8, 2020 special called meeting with no 
changes.  A voice vote was taken: 
Ayes:  All 
Nays:  None 
Motion passed 

 
II.  CHAIRMAN’S COMMENTS 

 
Chairman Studebaker greeted the audience and asked if anyone was planning on 
speaking in regards to the public hearing this evening to please stand and raise his/her 
right hand.  He then administered the oath. 
 

III.  PUBLIC HEARINGS 
 
A. 2020-01 CENTRAL SCHOOL REZONING 

Chairman Studebaker called for a motion to open the public hearing for Case 2020-
01. 
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Commissioner O’Connor made a motion, seconded by Commissioner Carmody to 
open the public hearing for Case 2020-01.  A voice vote was taken: 
Ayes:  All 
Nays:  None 
Motion passed 

 
Staff Presentation 
 
Jamie Tate, Consulting Planner, said the applicant is requesting to rezone Central 
School located at 410 McCarthy Road from R-4A Single-Family Infill and 
Preservation District to Institutional District (INT).  The property is approximately 
5.3 acres of School District owned land.  It is surrounded by R-4A which is mostly 
existing single-family homes.  There are condos to the west of the subject property in 
the former school building.  There are also baseball fields and what they call the 
“bowl” located to the west.  The Comprehensive Plan does label it as Institutional 
Land Use on the Future Land Use Map.  The school has not submitted any additional 
proposals or plans for the property that accompanies the rezoning of the land.  The 
purpose of the request is so the District can further utilize Central School for further 
activities. 
 
The property consists of a school, parking, an accessory building, and open space.  
The school closed in June of 2011 and has been vacant since.  To the west is the 
“bowl” and this request does not include that property because it is owned by the 
Village of Lemont.  It was transferred to the Village on December 19, 2005.  At that 
time is was for the purpose of flood control and in the form of an Intergovernmental 
Agreement (IGA).  The school still has access rights and easements to this property.  
It is in the best interest typically in the Village to bring the zoning map in line with 
the Comprehensive Plan when both parties are willing to and able.  The Village just 
saw recently another Institutional Zoning with the Hindu Temple on Lemont Road.  It 
also had residential zoning and it was changed to Institutional as well. 
 
Mrs. Tate stated if you read the purpose of the different zonings in the UDO you 
would find that the school building and associated uses fall more in line with the 
Institutional District.  The institutional district is designed to provide an environment 
for land uses of a civic, educational, governmental, recreational and religious nature.  
When you read through the residential district it is more focused for residential 
buildings and structures.  Staff did provide a use comparison in staff’s packet.  
Schools are allowed in residential district but only as a special use.  Typically you do 
find schools in residential districts when they have special use permits.  Then over 
time you can rezone them to a private institutional zoning district or a public private 
one. The zoning change would remove the possibility of any residential uses in this 
building.   It also removes daycare and child care facility or lodge at this time.  It does 
allow for hospital or large entertainment complex but these large style uses would 
require a public hearing with a special use process and not allowed by right.   
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The La Salle Factors are used when evaluating the validity of zoning changes.  Staff 
did find the zoning change compatible with the existing use and zoning of nearby 
property and rezoning the property will not diminish property values.  The public will 
gain the assurance that the property will stay more of an institutional type use rather 
than a use only found in residential districts such as homes, a bed and breakfast or a 
lodge. The zoning change will be more suitable for the subject property rather than 
residential zoning.  The zoning change will be more in line with the Comprehensive 
Plan since it designates the subject property Institutional.   
 
Mrs. Tate said in conclusion, staff recommends approval of the zoning change.  The 
rezoning would allow the school district flexibility to utilize the school for various 
activities that meet the UDO assisting in the utilization of a vacant building.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there were any questions from the Commission for 
staff. 
 
Commissioner McGleam asked when did the property change to R-4A. 
 
Mark Herman, Community Development Manager, said the initial building was 
constructed in possibly the 1940’s with an addition in the 60’s.  The zoning must have 
predated the creation of the Institutional Zoning District.  
 
Commissioner Zolecki stated it is very typical seeing school’s in residential districts.  
He asked if staff knew what some of the activities might be for the school.   
 
Mrs. Tate said someone from the school district is here this evening and they might 
be able to answer the question.   
 
Commissioner O’Connor asked if the garage storage building was going to be 
allowed. 
 
Mr. Herman stated it would be an accessory use to the principle use of the property.  
It could be utilized as part of reestablishing a school at some future date.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there are any further questions from the Commission 
for staff.  None responded.  He said he would be abstaining from voting on this public 
hearing because he has a potential conflict of interest since he does attend the start-up 
church that will be meeting there at the school.  He then asked if there is someone 
from the School District present to make a presentation.  He then asked all of the 
public that arrived late to please stand and raise his/her right hand.  He then 
administered the oath. 
 
Applicant Presentation 
 
Dr. Courtney Orzel, Superintendent, said she did not plan a presentation.  The school 
is looking for more flexibility.  There is a religious education that wants to utilize the 
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property.  There is no intent of opening Central School for full day Kindergarten for 
the upcoming school year.  In the future with the increasing enrollment the Board has 
conducted a facility study of Central, in the event that they would need to re-open it 
because they have reached the capacity at the three other schools.  As a result, the 
Board would like to rezone not only to align to the Village’s Comprehensive Plan but 
for their future so they don’t need to come back and rezone once again if they ever 
decided to reopen Central.  This would give them more flexibility other than that 
there are no other recent activities that have been presented to them that they would 
want to rent out Central for. 
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if the Commission had any questions for the applicant. 
 
Commissioner Cunningham asked what religious organization is planning on using 
the building. 
 
Chairman Studebaker stated it is called The Table. 
 
Commissioner Pawlak asked if this organization was going to utilize the facility 
would they be doing anything that would incur costs to the school if it was converted 
back to a school. 
 
Ms. Orzel said no.  If they convert it back to a school they would have to do a full 
renovation of the building.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there were any further questions from the Commission.  
None responded.  He then asked if there was anyone in the audience that wanted to 
speak in regards to this public hearing.   
 
Public Comment 
 
Mark Raines asked if this religious group was currently using Central School. 
 
Mr. Herman stated yes and that is what brought the rezoning forward.  When they 
realized given the existing zoning it would require some sort of zoning action whether 
through a special use process or the rezoning.  Staff had told the School District that 
the zoning change would make the most sense.   
 
Commissioner Pawlak asked who pays for the cost of electric or gas when the school 
is being utilized.   
 
Ms. Orzel said there is a rental process that they do with any of the organizations.  
The School District has been able to keep up some of the main Central pieces.  They 
do have maintenance people that will go to the facility.   
 
Jodi Richert asked if this change will prevent it from becoming residential property.   
 

5



5 
 

Mr. Herman stated it is currently zoned residential which then it is allowed.  If the 
application is approved by the Village Board then residential would not be allowed.   
 
Ms. Richert asked what is the likelihood of the school reopening.   
 
Commissioner Pawlak said it was stated based on the studies that they were doing and 
as the population is increasing there may be a need. 
 
Ms. Richert confirmed that The Table is currently renting from the school and will 
continue to rent. 
 
Mr. Herman stated yes that is their understanding. 
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there is anyone else in the audience that wanted to 
speak in regards to this public hearing.  None responded.  He then called for a motion 
to close the public hearing for Case 2020-01. 
 
Commissioner Pawlak made a motion, seconded by Commissioner Cunningham to 
close the public hearing for Case 2020-01.  A voice vote was taken: 
Ayes:  All 
Nays:  None 
Motion passed 
 
Plan Commission Discussion 
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there were any further questions or comments from the 
Commission.  None responded.  He then called for a motion for recommendation. 
 
Plan Commission Recommendation 
 
Commissioner Cunningham made a motion, seconded by Commissioner O’Connor to 
recommend to the Mayor and Board of Trustees approval of Case 2020-01 Central 
School Rezoning.  A roll call vote was taken: 
Ayes:  Cunningham, O’Connor, Zolecki, McGleam, Pawlak, Carmody 
Nays:  None 
Abstain:  Studebaker 
Motion passed 
 
Findings of Fact 
 
Commissioner McGleam made a motion, seconded by Commissioner Pawlak to 
authorize the Chairman to approve the Findings of Fact for Case 2020-01 as prepared 
by staff.  A voice vote was taken: 
Ayes:  All 
Nays:  None  
Motion passed 
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IV.  ACTION ITEMS 

 
A. 19-03 TIMBER RUN FINAL PLAT AND PLANNNED UNIT 

DEVELOPMENT 
 
Staff Presentation 
 
Jamie Tate said on November 27, 2019 Taylor Morrison filed an application 
requesting a Final Plat of Subdivision and Final Planned Unit Development for a 52 
unit attached single-family and 42 unit detached single-family residential subdivision.  
On June 10, 2019 Timber Run was rezoned to R-5A Single-Family Detached and 
Residential District.  At that time it was approved for a Preliminary PUD and Plat for 
a residential subdivision.  The review of the Final PUD and Plat is to verify the plans 
are in conformance with the previous approvals.   
 
Substantial compliance must be found with the Final PUD and Plat, so they cannot 
change the number of dwelling units, can’t increase the height of the buildings, 
building materials need to be the same or equal quality and the quality of landscaping 
materials need to be the same.  Any changes to final engineering cannot change any 
design characteristics.  The reason they were approved as a PUD had to do with the 
number of units and also the size of the property.   The subdivision does meet all of 
the lot and dimensional standards of the R-5A District.  There were some departures 
from the UDO which are listed in staff’s report.  She then read those departures.   
 
Mrs. Tate stated they did meet all the general conditions that were listed which 
mostly had do with the submittal of plans.  The applicant will meet all the specific 
conditions that were found in the preliminary PUD.  She then read through the 
specific conditions.  No changes have been proposed with the Final PUD and Plat.  
The applicant had stated the Park District agreement is in final stages and under 
review.  Staff is recommending approval of the Final PUD and Plat with conditions 
that are listed in staff’s report.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if any of the Commissioners had any questions for staff. 
 
Commissioner Zolecki said since this is the Final PUD and Plat the Commission is 
here this evening to verify that this application is in compliant to what was approved 
for the Preliminary.     
 
Mrs. Tate stated that is correct.  The applicant is not changing the number of units or 
any of the architectural standards.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki clarified that what was approved by the Village Board in June 
2019 had a lot of information that this Commission did not see. 
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Mrs. Tate said correct.  This Commission saw the original and a lot of the comments 
that were heard at that meeting were incorporated into the plans that ultimately went 
before the Village Board.  So what they are seeing in the Final might be a little 
different than what the Commission originally saw.   
 
Mr. Herman stated an example would be the architectural standards.  This was 
something that was not presented before this Commission last April.  There was 
discussion at the Planning and Zoning Meeting and at their Committee of the Whole 
meeting.  As part of the process they refined their plans and provided some 
architectural guidelines that are more stringent then what would otherwise be found in 
the code.  These guidelines were incorporated in the ordinances that was approved by 
the Board in June.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki said another example is that the Village hired KLOA to do 
somewhat of a review of the traffic study and the design.  He stated KLOA did have a 
recommendation for consideration of the four-way stop.  He asked if that was being 
pursued.    
 
Mr. Herman stated the intersection didn’t warrant a four-way stop sign, but to 
promote safety and reduce speeds on Timberline, KLOA’s response was if they were 
to pursue additional measures this is what they would recommend.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki asked if that path was chosen. 
 
Mr. Herman said yes it was.   
 
Chairman Studebaker confirmed that Lot 98 was going to be a park. 
 
Mrs. Tate stated yes it is. 
 
Chairman Studebaker asked about the sidewalk coming from Timberline into the 
subdivision.   
 
Mr. Herman said they are asking for a variance or departure from putting a sidewalk 
in from the north side of Timberline into the subdivision because of the topography 
and there is no connectivity.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if the Commissioners had any further questions for staff.  
None responded.  He then asked the applicant to come up and make a presentation. 
 
Applicant Presentation 
 
Vince Rosanova stated he is here this evening on behalf of Taylor Morrison and he is 
available to answer any questions that the Commission might have.   
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Commissioner Cunningham said there are few items that are still waiting to be 
finalized like the maintenance of the retaining walls and the detention basin for the 
HOA.  He asked if it has been formalized. 
 
Mr. Rosanova stated the HOA will be responsible for the maintenance of the retaining 
walls as well as the detention basin.  The provisions will be incorporated into the 
declarations of restrictions that the HOA will enforce.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there were any further questions for the applicant from 
the Commission.  None responded.  He said this is not a public hearing but the 
Commission will allow anyone that wants to make a statement to do so at this time. 
 
Public Comment 
 
Kathy Hendrickson said she was at the first public hearing and she remembers the 
detention ponds being mentioned and the slope.  She is concerned that this area is 
going to have issues with the run-off.  She is in charge of the Woodland Trails by the 
Township so she is aware of how much run-off there can be.  She is concerned that 
the HOA is going to be maintaining it and it might cause problems for the 
homeowners and also for the homeowners on New Avenue.  She would suggest they 
look at this again to make sure they are aware of any issues before turning it over to 
the HOA.  The homeowners should be made aware that they will be in charge of that 
retaining wall and basin.   
 
Commissioner McGleam clarified that the detention basins are going to be dry 
detention basins. 
 
Mr. Rosanova stated they are dry basins. 
 
Eric Schmidt asked with the dry detention basins are there ever water in them. 
 
Mr. Herman said they are designed to be dry.  A wet detention basin is designed to 
have water in it all the time.  A dry basin would only have water in it during a storm 
event and then release it into the storm system.  
 
Mr. Schmidt asked how do they build that on the hill with the slope.  The applicant is 
also asking for a slope of 8 instead of 4.  It is a very steep hill to put a detention pond 
there.   
 
Mr. Herman stated civil engineers are designing the plan and the Village’s Engineer 
is reviewing the plan.  The storm water is regulated by MWRD (Metropolitan Water 
Reclamation Department) and the applicant is working with them to get the 
permitting for it.  The engineers at MWRD would not approve a permit if they felt it 
didn’t work.   
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Mr. Schmidt asked if there was a reason why the detention basin is supposed have a 
four foot max.   
 
Mrs. Tate said the variance has already been approved.   
 
Mr. Schmidt stated this was a concern from this Commission when they voted against 
this.  He just wanted to know why the code was specific with four feet.  We are not 
talking about building material or the width of a street which is more for aesthetics.  
He is wanting to get it on record as to why they are asking for double then what the 
code allows.  He asked what residents did Taylor Morrison meet with, when he is not 
aware of them meeting with any residents in the area. 
 
Mr. Herman said they were referring to the feedback that was provided from the 
public hearings.   
 
Dennis Doornbos stated at the last meeting there was comment from the Fire 
Department about this being a cul-de-sac with only one entrance and exit.  He asked 
if this was ever addressed.   
 
Mr. Herman said the Fire District did not attend any of the previous meetings but did 
attend the TRC (Technical Review Committee) meeting back 2018.  All plans have 
been sent to the Fire District for their review and they communicated no issues with 
this.  It was debatable if it is considered a cul-de-sac with the definition in the code.  
The Fire District approved the plans with comments in regards to placement of fire 
hydrants.   
 
Mr. Doornbos stated his other comment is in regards to the sidewalk along the hill.  It 
was granted a variance to not put a sidewalk in because it was too difficult but yet we 
can put an 8 foot detention pond there.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki said at the last Planning and Zoning meeting for this 
application that was not something this Commission agreed upon.   
 
Mr. Doornbos stated the stop signs that they have listed in the KLOA report do not 
make any sense for someone who lives there.  A person is not going to be able to stop 
on a hill during a snow storm.  He thinks this needs to be reviewed to make sure it is 
in a safe spot.   
 
Mr. Schmidt said in regards to the one way in/out, on November 20, 2019 Timberline 
was shut down because of a gas issue at Timberline Knolls across the street.  An 
emergency vehicle was not able to get through the area.  He wants to get it on record 
that it has already happened in the area and with this subdivision only having one 
entrance it could prevent emergency vehicles from getting through.   
 
Joan Walsh stated she lives on Timberline and will be directly affected by this 
development.  She has lived in the area for 32 years and have seen the problems with 
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that hill.  She strongly feels that a four way stop is not the smartest thing to do.  The 
traffic study was done mid-June when school was not in session and there was no 
snow.  There is no way someone is going to be able to stop at that stop sign coming 
up that hill during a snow storm. There was a stop there a long time ago and it was 
only there very briefly because it was too dangerous.  She was trying to get home on 
that November 20th day and had to go all the way around just to get to her house.  She 
is concerned about the amount of traffic that not only this subdivision will create but 
also from the two new buildings that Timberline Knolls just built.  Lemont is great 
with removing the snow but having a stop sign there on a hill during a snow storm is 
not a good idea.   
 
Mrs. Walsh asked at what stage does the HOA become responsible for those retaining 
walls.   
 
Mr. Rosanova said the developer is responsible for the retaining walls and detention 
basin until they turn it over to the HOA.  That happens when the development reaches 
75% occupancy.   
 
Mrs. Walsh asked what if 75% isn’t reached for years down the road and can the 
developer back out of this.   
 
Mr. Rosanova stated the detention basin will be built before the first occupancy 
permit is issued which is part of the site improvement plans along with the roads, 
sewer and water.   
 
Mrs. Walsh asked if this is approved when does the ground breaking taking place.   
 
Mr. Rosanova said they anticipate late spring or summer of this year.   
 
Mrs. Walsh asked when was the most recent traffic study done for this development. 
 
Mr. Herman stated May 17th was the date of KLOA’s response.  They made a number 
of recommendations and one was putting a stop a sign there.   
 
Mrs. Walsh said when she visualizes pulling out of that subdivision and you are 
facing east, she feels the site lines are going to be obstructed and you will not see the 
oncoming traffic.  She cannot stress how dangerous this situation is going to be.  She 
asked how come there is no longer a left turning lane on New Avenue that was 
proposed with the first development for this area.   
 
Mr. Herman stated this is a different development that has half the number of 
dwelling units being proposed so there is a less of a traffic impact.   
 
Mrs. Walsh said she rides the Metra train and she understands that apparently Metra 
cannot increase the number of trains coming in/out of Lemont.  More people are 
commuting to the city and that train is packed.  If you are adding more homes this is 
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going to increase the means of transportation and this needs to be looked at.  She 
asked if the Army Core of Engineers were brought in because of all of the ravines.   
 
Mr. Herman stated that is noted on the Village Engineer’s comment letter from 
January 13, 2020 that it is in progress.  There are several outside entities that would 
be involved in the review process.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there was anyone else in the audience that would like 
to ask questions or make comments.  None responded. 
 
Larry Rizzo, Lemont Park District, said the Park District is in the process of 
completing negotiations with Taylor Morrison in regards to a park.  This should be 
completed before the Committee of the Whole meeting on February 28, 2020.  Back 
in April there were some concerns in regards to the retaining walls at the park 
property.  The Park District did choose the option that totally eliminated the retaining 
walls.   
 
Mrs. Walsh asked if there were sidewalks coming out of this subdivision.   
 
Mr. Rosanova stated on the south side of the road there is a sidewalk that extends all 
the way out and aligns with the crosswalk.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there were any further questions or comments from the 
audience.  None responded.  He then asked if there were any further questions or 
comments from the Commission.  None responded.  He then called for a motion for 
recommendation.      
 
Plan Commission Recommendation 
 
Commissioner McGleam made a motion, seconded by Commissioner Cunningham to 
recommend to the Mayor and Board of Trustees approval of Case 19-03 Timber Run 
Final Plat and Planned Unit Development with staff’s conditions 1 through 6 listed in 
staff’s report.  A roll call vote was taken: 
Ayes:  McGleam, Cunningham, Zolecki, O’Connor, Carmody, Pawlak, Studebaker 
Nays:  None 
Motion passed 

 
V. GENERAL DISCUSSION 

 
A. TRAFFIC STUDY THRESHOLDS AND DISCUSSION 
 
Mr. Herman said after last month’s meeting staff felt it would be good to discuss 
thresholds for traffic studies and be able to get on the same page with the 
Commission.  Traffic studies are only mentioned in two spots in the UDO.  One of 
the them is with a PUD they should provide a traffic study.  There are some PUD’s 
that warrant them and some that don’t.  The other spot it is mentioned is in the streets 
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and alley section.  With that it is very broad and would require a traffic study with 
any engineering plan.  The Planning and Economic Development Director has the 
authority to waive this request so they do not get hundreds of traffic studies every 
year.  There were items such as the Kiddie Academy, that have come before the PZC 
and there were no issues and there was Hamilton’s just recently were it was 
mentioned having a traffic study.   
 
Mrs. Tate stated she has talked with a traffic engineer who has worked with other 
communities in Illinois.  With DeKalb they use a threshold of 100 new peaks to and 
from a property during a peak hour but he also stated if it is a complex traffic location 
that has a history of accidents.  The applicant would have to turn in a statement from 
a licensed traffic engineer stating whether or not they feel it does or does not meet 
this requirement.  The Village’s engineer would review this and either agree or not 
and determine if a further traffic study is needed.  Staff would like to get the 
Commission’s opinion as to whether the Village has thresholds or if it is a policy.   
 
Commissioner O’Connor asked if they are doing a basic study to determine this 100 
new peaks or just a guess.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki said he has talked with traffic engineers and most 
municipalities can identify quickly as to whether a traffic study is needed or not.  
There is a certain point of common sense and there is some reasonableness at a staff 
level.  If the Village was going to retain a traffic engineer at a low hourly cost this is 
something they can quickly look at and reference their standards to determine 
whether the applicant needs to do a further traffic study or not.    
 
Mr. Herman stated he believed they have formulas that they can use and look at.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki asked if they would leave the requirement and the waiver 
process would come by way of a traffic engineer, hired by the applicant, to provide a 
letter stating that a traffic study is not needed.   
 
Commissioner Pawlak asked if the Village had a traffic engineer. 
 
Mr. Herman said they do not have a traffic engineer.  The Village’s consulting 
engineer is with Novotny Engineer and Jim Caincar is not a traffic engineer.  He 
remembers having discussions with Mr. Caincar for Timber Run recommending to 
send it out to a firm for a traffic study.  There are multiple engineers that they know 
of that they could send stuff out to, but as of right now they do not have anyone on 
retainer.   
 
Commissioner McGleam asked if the Village Engineer has the capacity or expertise 
to make that call as to whether a traffic study is needed or not.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki stated if the community is raising concerns then you have to 
do a traffic study and that is the cost of doing business for the planned development.  
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Timber Run is a good example where what they saw in April was a regurgitation of 
Vistancia’s traffic study which was not applicable.  Then in late April they went out 
and got one and presented it to the Board.  The Village then went above and beyond 
and had KLOA do a third party assessment of that traffic study.   
 
Mr. Herman said KLOA was primarily looking at the entrance because there was 
such a concern.  He and Mrs. Tate were not here for the Vistancia traffic study, but 
Taylor Morrison hired a different traffic firm and they updated it.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki stated what he is saying for that case the Village was doing a 
commendable job doing their due diligence.  It is a validation based on two different 
professional companies of something that did not happen initially from the applicant 
as they came before the Commission in April.  It was a non-applicable traffic study 
from a different development.  The diligence there helps protect the Village and helps 
answer to the community.  He feels it is dangerous to get into this threshold 
determination because you never know every situation. 
 
Mr. Herman said that is what is happening right now.  With Hamilton’s the applicant 
is not a developer and one estimate for a traffic study was $8,000, which is a difficult 
burden to put on someone who isn’t a developer.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki stated that might be where a firm like KLOA might be able to 
give advice.  There are different levels of analysis that can be done, which might not 
include an analysis of someone clicking cars all week.  It might be more economical 
than a full blown traffic study.   
 
Mr. Herman said staff does not have the guidance that is why they thought maybe 
having a threshold would help determine.   At least they could have a traffic engineer 
state whether or not it would be a minimal or substantial traffic impact.   
 
Commissioner McGleam stated the recommendation sounds reasonable to him, but 
there may be some very small developments where it is not reasonable.   
 
Commissioner Pawlak said he feels there should be a more simple process where 
there should be some common sense.  For Hamilton’s they should be able to hire a 
traffic engineer for an hour and based on information they submit to them about how 
many customers they bring in during their peak time they could determine if there is a  
problem or not.  All that information could then be brought before the Commission 
for them to determine if a traffic study is warranted or not.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki stated if they had a traffic engineer on call for the Village they 
could ask the applicant if they want to have them look at the application for a low 
price.  The traffic engineer could asses quickly and determine if a traffic study is 
warranted or not then the applicant can decided if they want to waive that 
requirement. At least then they have something from a professional’s point of view 
and reviewed.   
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Commissioner Pawlak said when a developer comes in and before it comes before the 
Commission it should be asked of the applicant so it is not a surprise when they come 
before the Commission.   
 
Commissioner Carmody asked what is the threshold they should allow when 
referencing another traffic study.  He remembers Willow Pointe referencing a traffic 
study that was done about 10 years ago.  He asked at what point do they recognize 
that traffic is going to spill over into other areas and they need to reevaluate some of 
the impacts to other areas.   
 
Mr. Herman stated that is something they did talk about with Hamilton’s and if other 
developments come forward in the area. 
 
Chairman Studebaker said they should ask for the traffic study to be updated. 
 
Commissioner Zolecki asked if they could talk with a traffic engineer  about a fixed 
fee for preliminary reviews of any developments that staff feels are on the boarder 
and then that fee is passed on to the applicant.   
 
Mr. Herman stated they can reach out to some traffic engineers.   
 
Discussion continued in regards to the timing of when this preliminary review would 
be done and when the traffic study would be done by.   
 
Commissioner Cunningham said you need to take out the subjectivity and that is what 
a traffic engineer is going to do.   
 
Commissioner Zolecki stated he understands that there is concern regarding the 
timing of when a traffic study would be done if needed.  However, it will prove that 
due diligence is being done and it is just like all these other reviews that need to be 
done.   
 
Chairman Studebaker said there is always the option of tabling the case until the 
applicant is able to provide a traffic study. 
 
Mrs. Tate stated if they can make the applicant aware of it at TRC meeting that would 
be ideal and help with timing.   
 
Mr. Herman said it would be ideal to have a traffic engineer at TRC however that 
would be at the Village’s cost. 
 
Commissioner Zolecki stated it would be a more economical way to have them at the 
TRC meeting.  He does know that KLOA does do this for other municipalities.   
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Commissioner Pawlak said it would be a recommended approach because you can 
use the same person and they would get familiar with the town and streets.  
 
Commissioner Cunningham stated that would remove the subjectivity as to whether it 
is needed or not. 
 
Mr. Herman said staff can look further into this and follow-up at the next meeting.   
 
Chairman Studebaker asked if there was any further discussion regarding traffic 
studies.  None responded.  He then asked if any of the Commissioners had any further 
questions or comments.   
 
Commissioner Carmody asked what is the standard for street width and at what point 
do they consider the variance.   
 
Mr. Herman said the Comprehensive Plan calls for having a palate of different street 
types.  There might need to be some talk with the Village Engineer about what the 
standard is along with MWRD’s new standards coming.  This might initiate some 
code changes.  The code says for a local street it is 27 feet of pavement width.  
Pavement width shall mean from edge to edge of pavement and does not include the 
curb.   
 
Mrs. Tate stated they are starting to look at what other municipalities have.   
 
Mr. Herman said the problem is ComEd is going to want to start putting everything in 
the front so there are going to be front easements.  They will have to be careful with 
front easements and how small they are because of this and public utilities.   

 
VI.  AUDIENCE PARTICIPATION 

 
None 
 

VII.  ADJOURMENT 
 
Chairman Studebaker called for a motion to adjourn the meeting. 
  
Commissioner Pawlak made a motion, seconded by Commissioner Zolecki to adjourn 
the meeting.  A voice vote was taken:  
Ayes:  All 
Nays:  None 
Motion passed 
 
 
 
 
Minutes prepared by Peggy Halper 
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STAFF REPORT  
TO: Planning & Zoning Commission 
FROM: Jamie Tate, AICP, Consulting Planner  
THRU: Mark Herman, MPA, AICP, Community Development Manager   

 
CASE NUMBER & NAME 
2020-03 Pawl Subdivision  

 APPLICANT/PROPERTY OWNER 
John F. Pawl 

DATE 
March 4, 2020 
 

 PROPERTY ADDRESS/LOCATION 
465 Fourth Street 
PIN: 22-28-102-002-0000 

BRIEF SUMMARY OF REQUEST 
 
The Applicant, John Pawl, is requesting approval of variations from the 
Lemont Unified Development Ordinance (UDO) for the purpose to allow a 
subdivision of an existing 1-acre residential property into 3 single-family 
home lots. The subject property contains a single-family home addressed 
465 Fourth Street that will remain on Lot 1. The two new vacant lots (Lot 
2 and Lot 3) will be accessed from 5th Street and each available for 
construction of a detached single-family home. With the subdivision, the 
applicant is requesting variations for reduced lot widths and reduced lot 
area for each of Lots 2 and 3 along with relief from construction with curb 
and gutter and sidewalks along both 4th and 5th Streets.  
 
 MAP SOURCE: CC GIS  
     

EXISTING ZONING 
R-4, Single-Family 

Detached Residential 
District 

EXISTING LAND USE 
Single-Family home with 

detached garage 

SURROUNDING ZONING 
& LAND USE 

North: R-4, Hoffman 
Subdivision 
South: R-4, Brennan’s 
Erie Subdivision  
East:  R-4, Northview 
Park ballfield 
West: R-4, Detached 
single-family residences 

REQUESTED ACTIONS 
Variations to allow for the 
subdivision of existing lot 
into 3 single-family home 
lots. Existing home is to 

remain and the other two 
lots will be for new home 

construction. 

SIZE OF PROPERTY 
43,677 SF 
1.0 acres 

 

PROPERTY HISTORY 
The subject property is part of the Becker’s subdivision and is zoned R-4, Single-Family Detached Residential District. The 
applicant, Mr. Pawl, wishes to subdivide the property to create 3 lots, two of which will access 5th Street to be sold for the 
construction of a new home on each. Similar to the Hoffman Subdivision just north of the subject property and recently 
approved to create four buildable lots, Mr. Pawl will lose a portion of the lots (approximately 1,979 sf) due to right-of-way 
dedication along 5th Street. The existing home on 4th Street is to remain as is and will now be on its own separate lot.  
 
During the Hoffman Subdivision process, a Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) was approved between the Village, John 
Pawl and the Hoffman’s to clarify easements, right-of-way, recaptures, road development and the potential development of the 
properties. Additional MOUs were agreed to with other property owners along Fifth Street. This was associated with bringing 
utilities to the area in order to provide Village services for the applicant and the availability for others in the surrounding 
neighborhood.   

 
COMPATIBILITY with the COMPREHENSIVE PLAN 
 
 
The proposal is compatible with the Lemont 2030 
Comprehensive Plan as it promotes Infill Residential 
Development (INF). More discussion with the 
Comprehensive Plan will follow in Attachment 2.    

COMPATIBILITY with the UNIFIED DEVELOPMENT ORDINANCE 

 
The proposal is compatible with all aspects of the UDO besides 
the requested variations. Single-family homes are compatible 
with the neighborhood as the surrounding land use consists of 
all single-family homes, with the exception of the ball fields in 
the park.  

 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION:           APPROVE                               APPROVE WITH CONDITIONS                          DENY 

 
 
ATTACHMENTS 

1. Staff Analysis 
2. Site Photographs 
3. Final Plat and Variation Applications 
4. Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) R-29-19 

5. Final Plat by DesignTek Engineering dated 12/23/2019 
6. Final Engineering Plans by DesignTek Engineering dated 

1/23/2020 
7. Consultant and staff comment letters.  
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Attachment 1 – Staff Analysis – Pawl Subdivision with Variations 
       

Comprehensive Plan. The Lemont 2030 Comprehensive Plan identifies this area as Infill 
Residential. The Comprehensive Plan describes this area as: 

Properties within this district are existing residential neighborhoods, typically in platted subdivisions. 
New development in this district is expected to be minimal and generally limited to new construction 
on the few vacant lots in the area. Some redevelopment of older home sites may also occur over time, 
but would not likely increase the total number of dwelling units on the redevelopment parcels. Any new 
development or redevelopment will be consistent with the established character of these neighborhoods.  

The proposal to subdivide an existing lot to provide an additional 2 single-family home lots 
furthers the goals of the Lemont 2030 plan encouraging infill development in an established 
neighborhood. Although the subdivision is minimally increasing the total number of dwelling 
units, the proposed lots are infill lots of a smaller size that is encouraged by the 
Comprehensive Plan. In the ‘Our Homes’ section of the plan, it states to “allow detached 
single-family development on smaller lots” in order to achieve and maintain the right housing 
mix. The homes will be utilizing nearby utilities and existing infrastructure while designed 
to meet the residential design guidelines consistent with Lemont 2030 standards in order to 
maintain the established character of the neighborhood. Meanwhile, the preservation and 
utilization of the existing home on Lot 1 is also in line with the goal to ‘reinvest in Lemont’s 
housing stock’.  

 

Unified Development Ordinance (UDO). The following chart summarizes the requested 
variations from the UDO with staff comments and analysis.  

UDO 
Section 

UDO 
Standard 

Proposed  Staff Comments 

17.07.01 
(Table) 

Minimum lot 
size is 12,500 
sf for R-4. 

 

 

Minimum lot 
width is 90 

Minimum lot 
size is 8,904 sf. 

 

 

Minimum lot 
width is 65.93 
ft. 

The proposed lot size is a 29% variation from the UDO 
defined minimum lot size. The applicant is proposing 
dedicating (approx. 990 sf) of each proposed lot to the 
Village for public right-of-way along 5th Street. Staff finds 
this deviation acceptable due to the dedication and 
constraints of the property.  

The proposed lot width is a request for a 27% variation 
from the minimum of 90 ft. per the UDO. The other lots in 
the neighborhood and adjacent on 5th Street have similar 
lot width sizes compared to the 2 proposed new lots within 
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Dimensional Standards. The subject property is zoned R-4, Single-Family Residential 
Detached District. The proposed 2 new lots (Lot 2 and Lot 3) do not meet all required lot and 
dimensional standards in Table 17-07-01. See below for the comparison: 
 
 

Lot & Dimensional Standards  R‐4  Lot 2 and Lot 3 

Min Lot Size* 

 

12,500 SF 

 

8,904 SF* 

Min Lot Width* 

 

90 feet  65.98 feet* 

Min FY Setback 

 

25 feet  25 feet  

Min SY Setback 

 

16.5% of lot width (10.88’)  10.88 feet 

Min RY Setback 

 

30 feet  30 feet 

 

ft. for R-4 
lots.  

 

 

 

 
 

this subdivision. The applicant is still able to maintain the 
minimum side yard setback with the proposed lot width 
reduction (side yard setback is 16.5% of lot width).  The lot 
widths are the same as in the approved Hoffman 
Subdivision adjacent to this proposal. Staff finds this 
deviation acceptable. 

17.26.01 

(Table) 

Parkway 
width 
minimum of 
12 ft., 
sidewalk 
width 
minimum of 
five feet. 

The applicant 
is requesting a 
waiver from the 
requirement to 
construct a 
sidewalk along 
4th and 5th 
Street. 

While the adjacent properties do not have an existing 
sidewalk, there is the opportunity to provide a sidewalk 
when the neighboring lots develop along 5th Street. Staff 
suggests the applicant provide escrow for a future sidewalk 
when the adjacent property to the south develops (Erie’s 
Subdivision) and when the Hoffman Subdivision to the 
north is constructed. The same was approved for the 
Hoffman Subdivision. Fourth Street does not allow for the 
same opportunity as there are existing homes without 
sidewalks rather than vacant lots that will allow for new 
home construction. Lastly, there is an existing sidewalk 
associated with the ballfields across from the subject 
property on 4th Street.  

17.26.110 

 

 

Install curb, 
gutter and 
sidewalk 

Relief from 
constructing 
sidewalk and 
curb and gutter 
along 5th Street. 

Staff suggests the applicant provide escrow for a future 
sidewalk along 5th Street or to construct the sidewalk when 
the homes are to be built. Curb and gutter would not be 
appropriate for this proposal when the entirety of 5th Street 
does not have curb and gutter for their driveways, 
sidewalks and walkways.  
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Lot & Dimensional Standards 

(cont.) 

R‐4  Lot 2 and Lot 3 

Max Building Height  37 feet 

 

37 feet 

Max Lot Coverage  55% 

 

55% 

*Bolded and asterisk items do not meet the UDO requirements 

 

It should be noted that the requested variations are very similar to the approved adjacent 
Hoffman Subdivision (the subdivision of one lot with the demolition of an existing home for 
the construction of four new single-family homes). The two lot sizes for Lot 2 and Lot 3 in 
the Pawl Subdivision are smaller due to the Applicant preserving a larger Lot 1 along 4th 
Street in order to maintain a conforming lot for the existing home on Lot 1 to remain.  

 

STANDARDS FOR VARIATIONS  

UDO Section 17.04.150.D states that variation requests should be consistent with the 
following three standards to be approved: 
 

1. The variation is in harmony with the general purpose and intent of the Unified 
Development Ordinance; 
 
Analysis.  The general purpose of the UDO is specified in UDO Section 17.01.050.  Of 
the eight components listed, five are either not applicable to or unaffected by the 
variation request. The applicable three are discussed below:  

 

 Ensuring adequate natural light, air, privacy, and access to property.  
The proposed variations should not negatively impact light or air to the 
property. The new homes will still need to meet the maximum height 
requirement in the R-4 zoning district and maintain appropriate setbacks 
therefore not blocking light, air, or privacy. There is adequate access to the lots 
from 5th Street.  
 

 Protecting the character of established residential neighborhoods. 
The proposed lots should not alter the established surrounding residential 
area. The subject property is proposed to be split into detached single-family 
lots that are of similar width to the lots along 5th Street, including the recently 
approved Hoffman Subdivision. The average width of the lots along the east 
side of 5th St. is 66 feet and the proposed lots are 65.98 feet wide. The Hoffman 
lots are approved as 65.95 feet wide. The narrower and smaller proposed lots 
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fit the established character of the neighborhood better than the R-4 standards 
would since so many lots in this area do not meet the R-4 standards.   
 

 Accommodating development and growth that is consistent with the 
preceding purposes. The subject property is classified in the Lemont 2030 
Plan as Infill Residential (INF). A goal of the INF is construction of new home 
sites on the remaining vacant lots in the area that are consistent with the 
established character of the neighborhoods. Although the proposed lot is not 
vacant and there is an existing home to remain on the property, other sites in 
this area have been subdividing in a similar manner into lots comparable to 
the proposed subdivision. The homes will be required to meet the UDO’s 
residential design standards, landscaping standards and other requirements 
of the Village, therefore substantially consistent with the preceding purposes.  

 

2. The plight of the owner is due to unique circumstances, and thus strict enforcement 
of the Unified Development Ordinance would result in practical difficulties or impose 
exceptional hardships due to the special and unique conditions that are not generally 
found on other properties in the same zoning district; 
 
Analysis.  The UDO states that in making a determination whether there are unique 
circumstances, practical difficulties, or particular hardships in a variation petition, 
the Planning and Zoning Commission shall take into consideration the five (5) factors 
listed in UDO §17.04.150. D.2.   
 

o Particular physical surroundings, shape, or topographical 
conditions results in a particular hardship upon the owner as 
distinguished from a mere inconvenience. The subject property is 
surrounded by existing lots that do not all meet all the standards defined 
in the UDO for R-4 properties. The property is land locked and thus 
restricted by the narrower surrounding existing lots. The average lot in the 
surrounding area on 5th Street has a width of 66 ft. and the proposed lots 
have the same proposed width.  The proposed lot sizes, although smaller 
than the neighboring lots along the east side of 5th St., are close in size to 
the northern neighboring lots approved for the Hoffman Subdivision. While 
the above analysis speaks to the lot width and lot size, the side setbacks 
will meet the R-4 code if the lot width variation is granted.   

 
o The conditions upon which the petition for variation is based would 

not be applicable generally to other property within the same zoning 
district.  The conditions upon which the petition for variations are based 
on may be applicable to other properties within the same zoning district. 
The R-4 Detached Single-Family Zoning District is a large district with 
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much variety throughout the Village. This particular area of R-4 and 
specifically the block of homes on 5th Street have lots that do not meet all 
of the R-4 standards as well.  

 
o The alleged difficulty or hardship has not been created by any 

person presently having an interest in the property.  The difficulty is 
created by the current property owner (the applicant) as the request for the 
variations is from the property owner to subdivide a conforming lot into 
three that require variations from UDO. It must be noted that the 
variations for lot size and lot width are partially affected by the dedication 
of property along 5th Street. Although even with taking the dedicated sf into 
account, the lot width would still be the same as proposed, but the lot sizes 
would increase.  The applicant wishes to subdivide their property to sell 
lots and build homes rather than keep the existing conforming single-
family home on the existing lot.  

 

o The granting of the variations will not be detrimental to the public 
welfare or injurious to other property or improvements in the 
neighborhood in which the subject project is located.  The request 
should not be detrimental to public welfare or injurious to other properties 
or improvements. The property owner is requesting similar standards 
found on the lots already constructed on this block. Fifth Street does not 
have a public sidewalk or curb and gutter on their street. The properties 
across the street do not appear to meet all the lot and dimensional 
standards, specifically lot width. The applicant is proposing detached 
single-family home lots in an established single-family neighborhood. The 
applicant is proposing to dedicate a portion of the property for public right-
of-way increasing the width of the road in front of the proposed lots to 
improve the public access along 5th Street. 

 
o The variations will not impair an adequate supply of light and air 

to adjacent properties or substantially increase congestion in the 
public street or increase the danger of fire or endanger the public 
safety or substantially diminish or impair property values within 
the neighborhood. The variations would not endanger public safety, 
substantially impair property values, diminish adequate supply of light or 
air, or increase the danger of fire or congestion. The variations should 
result in an increase of the value of the subject property by developing it 
into two additional single-family home lots. The creation of two new home 
lots rather than one mitigates the size of any proposed homes. If the 
property was developed as only a single lot or two, the home(s) that would 
be permitted per UDO standards could be significantly larger than the 
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surrounding properties. Alternatively, the two new proposed lots have 
smaller building envelopes thus ensuring future homes constructed on the 
subject site would be less out of scale when compared to the existing 
surrounding homes. Additionally, the variations will increase the safety 
incoming and outgoing traffic by widening a portion of the existing road. 
Staff is also suggesting the applicants provide onsite parking for workers 
during the construction phase to not impact the existing streets.  

 
3. The variations will not alter the essential character of the locality and will not be a 

substantial detriment to adjacent property. 
 
Analysis. The variations will not alter the essential character of the local area as the 
proposal is for detached single family homes, which is consistent with surrounding 
land uses.  Additionally, the surrounding lots do not confirm to the standard R-4 lot 
widths and sizes. The proposed Pawl Subdivision sits in-between both the Erie and 
Hoffman subdivisions recently approved to have new home construction providing a 
unique opportunity to blend both a newer and older residentially developed area of 
town. Additionally, the proposal will achieve the goals of the Lemont 2030 
Comprehensive Plan as stated previously. 

 

CONCLUSIONS & RECOMMENDATIONS 

Engineering. The Village Engineer reviewed the plat and engineering documents and 
provided comments to the applicant. The engineer stated the final plat appears acceptable 
but had comments on the engineering plan. He believes there is a sewer/water conflict where 
the new sanitary sewer crosses under/over the existing water main on 5th Street and asked 
for clearance. There is also a comment regarding the sanitary sewer stub and ensuring it is 
located on or relocated into a PU & DE. The Village Engineer comment letter is provided in 
the attachments.    

Fire District. The Fire District did not have any comments regarding the proposed 
subdivision.  

Planning. The consulting planner has reviewed the subdivision for conformance and 
provided comments to the applicant. Staff is recommending an escrow for a future sidewalk 
on 5th Street and for the applicant to provide on-site parking for workers during construction. 
The planner has asked for clarification on the lot numbers stated on the plat and to adjust 
the rear building setback line for Lot 1. The planner has stated that all reasonable efforts to 
save any existing mature trees on Lots 2 or 3 should be made and the applicant shall provide 
a tree survey and tree preservation plan to verify the species and size of any existing trees. 
The full comment letter is provided in the attachments.  

24



Page | 7 
 

Conclusion. Although the 2 new proposed home lots will vary from some standard R-4 
requirements in the UDO, the proposed variations are consistent with the surrounding 
single-family homes that currently do not meet the minimum width standards required in 
UDO and the adjacent subdivisions that have been recently approved along 5th Street. 
Additionally, the proposal will achieve the goals of the Lemont 2030 Comprehensive Plan 
that designates this area as Infill Residential. The UDO requires that the applicant 
demonstrate consistency with all three of the variation standards contained within 
§17.04.150. D. and staff finds that all are generally met with conditions. Staff is 
recommending approval of Case 2020-03 Pawl Subdivision with Variations with the following 
conditions:  

1. Provide an escrow for the public sidewalk in front of both proposed lots on 5th Street 
or construct the sidewalks at time of permit for each home.  

2. Provide onsite parking for workers during construction of all lots.  

3. Provide a tree preservation plan and survey to verify if any trees can and should be 
saved on Lots 2 or 3.  
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 Attachment 2 

Site Photographs 

 

Figure 1: Existing home on 4th Street (Lot 1) to remain.  

 

Figure 2: Existing home on 4th Street (Lot 1) to remain. 

26



Page | 9 
 

 

 

Figure 3: View from 5th Street looking north at subject property. 

 

Figure 4: View from 5th Street looking onto subject property and the rear of 465 4th St.  
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Figure 5: Streetview looking at rear of 465 Fourth Street from 5th Street.
 

 

Figure 6: Streetview looking south down 4th Street with subject property (Lot 1) on the left. 
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Attachment 3 

Final Plat and Variation Applications 
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Attachment 4 

R‐29‐19 Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) 
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Attachment 5 

Final Plat by DesignTek 
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Attachment 6 

Final Engineering Plans by DesignTek 
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Covington Knolls Phase 8 5/21/2019 

John F. Pawl (Pawl Subdivision) 

465 Fourth Street 

Lemont, Illinois 60439 

PIN: 22‐28‐102‐002‐0000 
 

February 20, 2020 
 

RE: Pawl Subdivision Unified Development Ordinance (UDO) Review #1 

 

Dear Mr. John Pawl: 
 

The Village of Lemont has received your application and plans for a Final Plat of Subdivision with 

variations for a 3 lot single‐family home (re)subdivision located at 465 4th Street in Lemont IL. The 

following Unified Development Code (UDO) comments should be addressed regarding the proposal: 

 
 

Architecture 

1. Please note the new homes located on Lot 2 and Lot 3 will have to meet Section 17 of Ordinance 

849 for appearance standards, specifically §17.22 Residential Design Standards, which addresses 

anti‐monotony, construction materials, garage projections, etc. The homes will be reviewed for 

design at time of permit. 

 
 

Lot and Dimensional Standards 

2. The following Table 17‐07‐01 is provided to address the lot and dimensional comparisons for the 

proposed (3) lots to the R‐4 zoning district. The dimensions that do not meet the standards will 

require variances (bolded).  

 

Lot & Dimensional 
Standards 

R‐4  Lot 2 & Lot 3  Lot 1 

Min Lot Size* 
 

12,500 SF 
 

8,904 SF  21,522 SF 

Min Lot Width* 
 

90 feet  65.98 feet  131.77 feet 

Min FY Setback 
 

25 feet  25 feet   25 feet 

Min SY Setback 
 

16.5% of lot 
width (10.88’) 

10.88 feet  15 feet 

Min RY Setback 
 

30 feet  30 feet 
 

30 feet 

Max Building Height  37 feet  37 feet  37 feet 
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Max Lot Coverage  55% 
 

55%  55% 

 

 

Landscaping 

3. The lots must meet all requirements of §17.20 Landscape and Tree Preservation.  

4. Provide a tree preservation plan and tree survey to verify the species and size of the existing 

trees on Lots 2 and 3. Can any trees be saved? All reasonable efforts shall occur in the site 

design of a proposed development to preserve existing trees, especially mature trees, specimen 

trees, tree groves or tree lines.   

5. One canopy tree per 40 feet of street frontage will be required with a minimum of 3” caliper for 

Lots 2 and 3.  

6. Parkway trees shall be installed in the spring or fall, but not before the construction of the 

dwelling and the completion of the public sidewalk (if applicable). However, in no case shall 

parkway trees be planted later than 2 years after the commencement of construction of 

development (i.e. issuance of site development permit).  

 
 

Other Comments – Streets, Sidewalks, and Other 

7. The Final Plat references the proposal being both the Resubdivision of Lot 41 and in the Legal 

Description it references Lot 410. Clarify and adjust accordingly. 

8. The rear building setback line for Lot 1 is shown at 20 feet and it should be 30 feet for the zoning 

district. Adjust accordingly. 

9. The absence of a sidewalk along 5th Street will require a waiver from the UDO.  

10. The absence of curb and gutter along 5th street will require a waiver from the UDO. 

11. The subdivision will be required to meet the Land/Cash contributions in §17.18. 

12. Provide onsite parking for construction workers at time of development of any of the proposed 

lots in order to not disrupt the existing neighbors and block any part of the street.  

13. An escrow shall be required as a part of the sidewalk waiver so funds are available if a sidewalk 
was ever to be constructed along 5th Street. 

 
 

The purpose of this review is to make certain its general compliance with Village ordinances and standard practices 
regarding site development, landscaping and design. This review is only for general conformance with the design 
criteria established by the Village and is subject to both the completeness of the information submitted by the 
developer’s professional staff and also the actual ability of the plan to perform in accordance with its intent.  Actual 
field conditions may vary and additional items may arise which are not readily apparent based on this submittal.  
The developer’s design professionals are responsible for performing and checking all design computations, 
dimensions, and details relating to design, construction, compliance with all applicable codes and regulations, and 
obtaining all permits.  Additionally, other bodies of government may have jurisdiction over various aspects of this 
development.  The developer should be advised that additional measures may be required based on actual field 
conditions and formal approvals of the other agencies. 
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A written response must be provided to all comments with the next submittal. Please contact me with 

any further questions. 

 
 

Sincerely,  

 
Jamie Tate, AICP 

Consulting Planner 

630.640.5860 

jtate@lemont.il.us 
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                                     SITE PLUMBING  REVIEW 2 
 
DATE:              January 28, 2020       
 
PROJECT:     Pawl subdivision       
 
LOCATION:   Fifth St.      
 
CODE REFERENCED:  2014 Illinois Plumbing Code      
 
DRAWINGS SUBMITTED:  Site drawings 1&2 dated 1/23/20  
 
 
These plans are IN COMPLIANCE with the above applicable code/ordinance.  I have no 
additional comments at this time.  
 
Please keep “B” boxes in the ROW as shown 
 
 Please keep me informed of any changes in this project. 
 
This review is limited to a review of the information submitted and no responsibility is 
accepted for results of construction.  Failure to identify a code violation during this review 
does not relieve the owner of the obligation to compliance.  Final construction and 
installations must be in conformance with the code/ordinance. 
 
 
 
 
Martin Haidacher 
Village of Lemont 
Plumbing Inspector 
 
cc:  J. Cainkar 
            M. Herman 
 Joseph Francis, Plumbing Inspector 
           
 File 
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Jamie Tate

From: Mark Blackaller <mblackaller@lemontfire.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 12:27 PM
To: Mark Herman
Subject: RE:  [External Sender]  Pawl Subdivision - PZC plans

Mark, 
 
I have no comments at this time. 
 
Mark 
 

From: Mark Herman [mailto:MHerman@lemont.il.us]  
Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 2:37 PM 
To: Mark Blackaller <mblackaller@lemontfire.com> 
Cc: Jamie Tate <JTate@lemont.il.us> 
Subject: RE: Pawl Subdivision ‐ PZC plans 
 
Mark 
 
Does the FD have any comments on this proposed subdivision (see email from 1/28/20, see below) 
 
Mark 
 

From: Mark Herman  
Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2020 12:26 PM 
To: Jim Cainkar Main Account <jimcainkar@novotnyengineering.com>; Martin Haidacher <mhaidacher@lemont.il.us>; 
Mark Blackaller <mblackaller@lemontfire.com> 
Cc: Jamie Tate <JTate@lemont.il.us> 
Subject: Pawl Subdivision ‐ PZC plans 
 
All 
 
We have received plans for the proposed Pawl subdivision (465 4th Street) for PZC (Final Plat and Variations). Jim and 
Marty I will have hard copy plans for you. Electronic copies can be provided via the following link: 
https://lemont.sharepoint.com/:f:/g/ElTBPG1uf7RGisuCF5dqprwB‐3jyRORiOmnZ79U0Bg8Guw?e=a6Jf6q 
 
Please provide comments as soon as reasonable 
Thanks 
Mark 
 

Mark Herman, MPA, AICP 

Community Development Manager 
  
  

 
  

54



2

Village of Lemont  |  418 Main Street  |  Lemont, IL 60439 
p  630.257.1582  |  f  630.257‐1598  
mherman@lemont.il.us  |  www.lemont.il.us 
  
This message is intended only for the use of the person or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain information 
that is privileged, confidential, and exempt from disclosure under applicable law.  If the reader of this message is not the 
intended recipient or the employee or agent responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited.  If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by return e‐mail 
 

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the 
named addressee, you should not distribute or copy this email. Please notify the sender immediately by email if 
you have received this email by mistake and delete this email from your system. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing this communication is prohibited. Thank You  
 

  

This email has been scanned for spam and viruses by Proofpoint Essentials. Click here to report this email as 
spam. 
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STAFF REPORT  
TO: Planning & Zoning Commission 
FROM: Jamie Tate, AICP, Consulting Planner  
THRU: Mark Herman, MPA, AICP, Community Development Manager   

 
CASE NUMBER & NAME 
2020-04 406 Logan Variation 

 APPLICANT/PROPERTY OWNER 
Morgan Homes LLC / Brian Baetz 

DATE 
March 4, 2020 
 

 PROPERTY ADDRESS/LOCATION 
406 E. Logan Street (Corner of East St. and Logan) 
PIN: 22-29-219-001-0000 

BRIEF SUMMARY OF REQUEST 
The Applicant is requesting a variance to construct a new home with an 
attached side-loaded garage to be accessed from Logan Street rather than 
the alley, as required by the UDO. When an alley is available or existing 
in the R-4A zoning district, the UDO requires the garage on the lot to be 
accessed from the alley. The variation request would accommodate for the 
existing single-family home to be demolished and replaced with a new 
home and attached side-loaded garage. The existing home does not have a 
garage associated with the property but there is an alley adjacent to the 
site.  
 
The proposed new home to be constructed on the subject property will 
meet all R-4A setbacks, standards and other UDO requirements.  
 

 

MAP SOURCE: Cook County GIS  

     

EXISTING ZONING 
R-4A, Single-Family 

Preservation and Infill 
District 

EXISTING LAND USE 
Single-Family home  

SURROUNDING ZONING 
& LAND USE 

North: R-4A, Single-
family homes 
South: R-4A, Single-
family home  
East:  R-4A, Single-family 
homes 
West: R-4A, Single-family 
home 

REQUESTED ACTIONS 
Variation 

SIZE OF PROPERTY 
6,876 SF 
0.18 acres 

 
PROPERTY HISTORY 
At this time, the existing home on the subject property is in the process of being demolished with site prep for new construction. 
New homes in the surrounding area have been constructed in recent times with varying access ways to their personal garages. 
There is a decent mix of driveways and garages being access from the street and alleys.  A creek runs along the front of the 
subject property in the parkway area with retaining walls that appears to discourage street access for garages that are on the 
east side of East Street. The neighboring homes on the west side of East street have front-loaded garages with driveway access 
from East Street. There are multiple curb cuts and personal driveway access points on Logan Street adjacent to the subject 
property and across the street.  
 
COMPATIBILITY with the COMPREHENSIVE PLAN 
 

 
The proposal is adequately compatible with the Lemont 2030 
Comprehensive Plan as it promotes Infill Residential 
Development (INF). Further discussion of the 
Comprehensive Plan is in Attachment 2.  

COMPATIBILITY with the UNIFIED DEVELOPMENT ORDINANCE 
 

The proposal is compatible with all aspects of the UDO besides 
the requested variation. The new home will meet the bulk, lot 
and dimensional standards for the R-4A district along with the 
residential design guidelines. A single-family home is 
compatible with the neighborhood as the surrounding land use 
is all single-family homes.  
 
 

 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION:           APPROVE                               APPROVE WITH CONDITIONS                          DENY 

 

 
ATTACHMENTS 
 

1. Staff Analysis 
2. Site Photographs 
3. Variation Application and Worksheet 

4. Grading plan 
5. Architectural Plans for Permit 56
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Attachment 1 – Staff Analysis – 406 E Logan Street Variation 
       

Comprehensive Plan. The Lemont 2030 Comprehensive Plan identifies the subject site as 
Infill Residential. The Comprehensive Plan describes this area as: 

Properties within this district are existing residential neighborhoods, typically in platted subdivisions. 
New development in this district is expected to be minimal and generally limited to new construction 
on the few vacant lots in the area. Some redevelopment of older home sites may also occur over time, 
but would not likely increase the total number of dwelling units on the redevelopment parcels. Any new 
development or redevelopment will be consistent with the established character of these neighborhoods.  

The proposal furthers the goals and objectives to preserve Lemont’s single-family character 
and maintain high standards for residential design. The surrounding properties are single-
family homes therefore the new construction of a single-family home is consistent with the 
established neighborhood so long as it meets the residential architectural guidelines and 
UDO standards. The redevelopment of the site is not increasing the total number of 
dwelling units, rather utilizing more of the property to provide a modern and aesthetically 
pleasing residential home in an established desirable neighborhood.  

 

General Analysis.  

The proposed single-family home is designed to meet all requirements of the UDO (such as 
setbacks, landscaping, architecture, etc.), except the applicant is requesting one variance 
regarding the proposed attached side-loaded garage.  The following variation is proposed for 
the construction of a new detached single-family home:   

Code Section  UDO Requirement  Proposal and Analysis 

§17.07.020 F. 2.   If an existing alley provides 
access to the lot in question, 
then detached and attached 
garages shall be accessed from 
the alley.  

The new home is proposing a 
side‐loaded attached garage 
that is to be accessed from 
Logan Street rather than the 
alley adjacent to the lot. The 
existing home to be demolished 
did not have a garage 
associated with its property, 
therefore the alley did not serve 
the previous home as it does 
not serve other homes in the 
area along Logan Street.  There 
is an existing curb cut on Logan 
Street adjacent to the subject 
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property and closer to the 
intersection of Logan and East 
Streets that has not been 
currently utilized for driveway 
or garage access but may have 
been for a driveway in the past. 
The proposed new home is not 
utilizing this existing curb cut as 
its proposed driveway access is 
farther from the intersection 
and the existing curb cut will be 
closed with a barrier curb 
installed in its location.  

 

A standard for ‘suggested’ alleyway access first appeared in the Infill Design Guidelines 
adopted in July of 2004 for the Residential Preservation & Enhancement Overlay District. 
The guideline stated “whenever possible, garages shall be located according to the following 
order of priority: 

i. Detached garage, alley access; or 
ii. Attached garage, street access or alley access; or 

iii. Detached garage, street access; or 
iv. Side loaded attached garage, street acc. 

 

This guideline was likely created to assist staff, commissions and elected officials in 
providing standards and codes to help ensure infill development and tear downs stay within 
the character of the existing neighborhoods. While the guideline created in 2004 was more 
of a suggestion, over time it was likely codified in updates or when the R-4A district 
replaced the Preservation Overlay District.  

 

STANDARDS FOR VARIATIONS  

The new home at 406 E Logan Street requires a variation to the UDO as proposed with a 
side-loaded attached garage accessed from the street rather than the alley. UDO Section 
17.04.150.D states that variation requests must be consistent with the following three 
standards to be approved: 

1. The variation is in harmony with the general purpose and intent of the 
Unified Development Ordinance; 
 
The general purpose of the UDO is specified in UDO Section 17.01.050: 
 

 Promoting and protecting the public health, safety and general welfare;  
 Ensuring adequate natural light, air, privacy, and access to property; 
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 Avoiding or mitigating the hazards to persons and property resulting from 
accumulation of runoff or flood waters;  

 Protecting the character of established residential neighborhoods;  
 Maintaining and promoting economically vibrant and attractive commercial 

areas;  
 Establishing clear and efficient development review and approval procedures; 

and 
 Conserving the value of land and buildings throughout the Village; and 
 Accommodating development and growth that is consistent with the preceding 

stated purposes.  
 

Analysis. The proposed variation is generally in harmony with the above stated 
purpose statements found in the UDO. The most applicable purpose statement in 
this case would be “protecting the character of established residential 
neighborhoods’. The new home is designed to meet all the parameters of the R-4A 
zoning district except to access the garage from the street rather than the alley. As 
previously discussed, it is likely the alley requirement was placed in the UDO in 
order to maintain the character of the R-4A District concerning tear-downs and 
redevelopment of older home sites. This area of R-4A has a mix of garage entrances, 
some accessed from the street and some accessed from an alley. There is no defined 
character in this area of R-4A in regards to access to detached or attached garages, 
but the requirement remains nonetheless. The proposed attached garage on the new 
home is not visible from the front elevation and blends within the left elevation 
meeting the maximum driveway width and garage size requirement for the district. 
The style of the home appears to be an appropriate blend of old and new architecture 
while providing modern amenities, such as an attached garage and back yard, that 
homeowners desire.  
 

2. The plight of the owner is due to unique circumstances, and thus strict enforcement 
of the Unified Development Ordinance would result in practical difficulties or impose 
exceptional hardships due to the special and unique conditions that are not generally 
found on other properties in the same zoning district; 
 
Analysis.  The UDO states that in making a determination whether there are unique 
circumstances, practical difficulties, or particular hardships in a variation petition, 
the Planning and Zoning Commission shall take into consideration the factors listed 
in UDO §17.04.150. D.2.   
 
 Particular physical surroundings, shape, or topographical conditions 

results in a particular hardship upon the owner as distinguished from a 
mere inconvenience.  

o Analysis. There does not appear to be a topographical condition or 
surrounding that results in a hardship upon the owner. While there is a 
creek running in front of the proposed home in the parkway, a front-loaded 
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garage to be accessed from East Street is not an allowed option in the UDO 
anyhow, therefore this physical condition does not affect the proposal. The 
site is pitched and on a hill with the lowest point on East Street, but this 
would likely not affect a garage to be accessed from the street also.  

 
 The conditions upon which the petition for variation is based would not 

be applicable generally to other property within the same zoning district.   
o Analysis. There are other sites within the R-4A District that could have 

the same situation as the proposal, but it is less likely since this is a corner 
lot. While studying other similar lots throughout the R-4A District, staff 
has found examples of existing homes on corner lots in the R-4A District 
that either have detached or attached garages with access to an alleyway 
but instead access if from the adjacent street:  

i. 700 Singer Avenue 
ii. 800 Singer Avenue 

iii. 59 E. Eureka Drive 
iv. 733 Singer Avenue  
v. 730 State Street 
vi. 801 Sobieski Street 

While this is not justification for the proposed variance, it is merely 
examples of lots where the petition for variation could be applicable to other 
properties in the same district, as similar proposals already exist.  

 
 The alleged difficulty or hardship has not been created by any person 

presently having an interest in the property.   
o Analysis. The hardship has been created by the applicant as they desire 

to access the attached garage from Logan Street rather than the adjacent 
alleyway.   

 
 The granting of the variation will not be detrimental to the public welfare 

or injurious to other property or improvements in the neighborhood in 
which the subject project is located.   

o Analysis. The variation should not be detrimental to the public welfare or 
injurious to other property or improvements in the neighborhood. The 
previous home had not been utilizing the alley in the past and there is an 
existing curb cut that is along Logan Street within the subject property. 
The neighboring properties across from the subject property along Logan 
Street have curb cuts to access their personal driveways from the street 
rather than an alley. The property to the east and rear of the subject 
property has a curb cut and driveway to Logan Street while being adjacent 
to the existing alleyway. The proposed home will likely complement the 
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newer homes just south of the subject property along East Street and be an 
improvement to the neighborhood.  
 

 The variation will not impair an adequate supply of light and air to 
adjacent properties or substantially increase congestion in the public 
street or increase the danger of fire or endanger the public safety or 
substantially diminish or impair property values within the 
neighborhood.  

o Analysis. The proposed variation should not substantially increase 
congestion in the public street or endanger the public safety or 
substantially diminish property values within the neighborhood. The new 
home is designed to meet the bulk and dimensional standards appropriate 
for the existing zoning district. The variation to access the garage from the 
street rather than the alley is consistent with other homes along Logan and 
it is also consistent with the neighboring property to the east. There is not 
an increase in dwelling units as the proposal is to replace a single-family 
home with a more modern and desirable single-family home.  

 
3. The variation will not alter the essential character of the locality and will not be a 

substantial detriment to adjacent property.  
 
Analysis. It does not appear the variation will alter the essential character of the 
locality or be a substantial detriment to adjacent property. The new home has been 
designed to fit all other parameters of the zoning district and aesthetically designed 
to blend in the neighborhood while exceeding the Village’s residential design 
standards. The adjacent properties are a mix of different residential styles with no 
clear pattern or defined character. While there is an alleyway available to some 
properties in the area, many homes do not utilize the alley or it is insufficient in width 
or construction in some areas as well. Since the adjacent property in the rear along 
Logan has driveway access from the street and others across the street, the proposed 
variation should not be a detriment to adjacent property.  

 

CONCLUSIONS & RECOMMENDATIONS 

The demolition of the existing single-family home to allow for a new home on the subject 
property requires a variation from the UDO to allow an attached side-loaded garage to be 
accessed from Logan Street rather than the adjacent alleyway. The previous home did 
not have a driveway or garage from either the alley or Logan Street. Since many of the 
neighboring properties and homes in close proximity access their garages from either East 
Street or Logan Street, staff does not feel the request should be a substantial detriment 
to the adjacent properties or alter the essential character of the neighborhood.  The 
following conditions should be considered with the variation request:  
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1. Provide a sidewalk along Logan Street for the duration of the property connecting 
to the sidewalk on the corner of Logan and East Street.  

2. Make a good faith effort to save the existing tree(s) along Logan Street and work 
with the Village Arborist on the best approach.  
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Attachment 2 

Site Photographs 

 

Figure 1: View from Logan Street looking at existing home and alleyway access. 

 

Figure 2: View from Logan Street looking down alleyway. 
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Figure 3: View from Logan looking down East Street at creek and retaining wall. 

 

Figure 4: View looking east down Logan with subject property on the right and visible 
driveway curb cuts for homes on the left along Logan Street. 
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Attachment 3 

Variation Application and Worksheet 
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Attachment 4 

Grading Plan 
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Architectural Plans for Permit 
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